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STAFF ACTIVITIES

Dr. Samuel Van Valkenburg had
three articles published this spring
including “Iraq” in the January, 1954
issue of Focus, “The Hashemite King
dom of the Jordan:” a study in Eco
nomic Geography, Volume 30, April,
1954., and “Iraq,” in Social Education,
Volume 18, March, 1954.

In March he visited his home in
Holland for about ten days in order
to see his sister who has been seriously
ill.

On April 28th he left for a two
week lecture trip to the West coast
where he visited Chico State College,
Oregon State College, the University
of Washington, Bellingham College of
Education, San Francisco State Col
lege, the University College of Los
Angeles, and the University of South
ern California. He also gave the chief
conference lecture at the meeting of
the California Council of Geography
Teachers.

During the summer school he will
give one class in Political Geography.

Dr. Raymond E. Murphy attended
the meeting of the Association of
American Geographers in Philadel
phia where he was a discussant in the
Urban Section and in the section on
Problems in the Geography of the
United States. Dr. Murphy was a
member of the retiring Council of the
Association.

Dr. Murphy was responsible for the
Introduction and Conclusion of the
section on “The Fields of Economic
-Geography” and the chapter on

“The Geography of Mineral Produc
tion” in American Geography: In’ven
tory and Prospect, published this
spring.

An article titled, “Delimiting the
CBD”, by Dr. Murphy and Dr. J. E.
Vance, Jr. will appear in the july.
1954, issue of Economic Geography.
This summer they will be working on
two further articles concerned with
the Central Business District.

Dr. Edward Higbee presented a
paper at the Association meeting in
Philadelphia titled, “Emerging Trends
in Eastern Mountain Agriculture.”

He has been spending some time this
spring in summarizing the results of
field work undertaken last year
throughout the United States and will
continue this work on Martha’s Vine
yard where he plans to spend the
summer with his family in a newly
acquired cottage.

Dr. Dieter Brunnschweiler re-opened
the weather station at Clark this
spring and has an enthusiastic group
of some 20 amateur weather fore
casters who have been quite success
ful in their predictions. Dr. Brunn
schweiler attended the meetings of
the Association of American geog
raphers in April and did some travel
ing along the coastal plain as well.
He has an invitation to go to Syracuse
to give a lecture in May on his
private research into climatological
classification.

In June Dr. and Mrs. Brunnschwei
Icr will leave for Bolivia. He
will be one of a group of four
teen comprising a United Nations
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Mission to Bolivia and will be a
climatology consultant for the Bolivian
Department of Agriculture. He will
work on an analysis of Bolivian cli
mate, and aid agricultural experts in
determining new alpine agricultural
procedures possible on the Altiplano
of Bolivia.

Dr. Brunnschweiler also. plans to
work on a private research project
concerning glaciation in the Andes.

At present he plans to be in Bolivia
until July, 1955. His address will be:
do United Nations Mission, La Paz,
Bolivia.

Dr. Hassan Awad, Director of
Geography at Ibrahim University.
Cairo, Egypt, who is a visiting lec
turer at Clark this year, journeyed
to Washington and Detroit this spring.
In April he was one of the speakers
at an all-day Conference at Clark on
the topic, “Africa in the World of
Today.” In June he will start his trip
home via the Pacific. He has been in
vited on a field trip to study the desert
of California by Dr. Richard Logan of
the University of Southern Califor
nia. After this he will visit Japan,
Hong Kong, Indonesia, Thailand,
India, and possibly Iran before arriv
ing in Cairo at the end of September.
Clark alumni have been alerted along
his route and he is looking forward to
meeting geographers in each country
he will visit.

Mr. Guy Burnham has been busy
with his class in cartography this
spring. He has also been directing
two assistants in cartographic work
for Economic Geography. Occasional
ly he has been presented with unusual
problems by the lay public. A school
teacher who is a hay broker on the
side came in to inquire about the soils
of Cayuga County, New York State.
He was weighing the potential quality
of New York hay against Canadian
hay.

This summer Mr. Burnham will be
busy in the cool depths of the Geog
raphy building with his summer class
in cartography and will be .relaxing
in his garden whenever possible.

ROBERT G. BUZZARD
HONORED

On October 3,. 1953, President
Robert G. Buzzard (Ph.D. Clark,
1925) was honored at a special Convo
cation held at Eastern Illinois State
College, Charleston, Illinois. The oc
casion was the 20th anniversay of Dr.
Buzzard’s appointment as President
of Eastern Illinois State College.

More than a score of geographers
who now hold graduate degrees from
Clark and other universities were Dr.
Buzzard’s students when he served as
Head of the Department of Geog
raphy at Illinois State Normal Uni
versity during the decade preceding
his college presidency.

Five geographers with Ph.D. de
gress from Clark were students of
Dr. Buzzard, while an equal number
of his former students hold Ph.D. de
grees in geography from other uni
versities. No less than seventeen of
his former students hold M.A. degrees
in geography from Clark as does his
son, Henry Buzzard. This record of
inspiring his students to successful
graduate work in geography tells
more adequately than words the
quality of Dr. Buzzard’s leadership
and teaching.

THE SUMMER SCHOOL
PROGRAM

Beginning June 28th, the Summer
School this year will comprise one
six and one-half week session. This
session has “Problems of Citizenship
To-day” as its theme and includes
courses for teachers, rraduate stu
dents, and undergraduates.

Four courses will be offered by the
School of Geography. Dr. Samuel
Van Valkenburg will present “Ele
ments of Political Geography.” Dr.
Earl Shaw, Worcester State Teachers
College, will give courses on “Princi
ples of Human Geography” and
“Principles of Economic Geography.”
Mr. Guy Burnham will present
“Cartography.”

ALUMNI ACTIVITIES
Abrahamson, Sherman R. (Ph.D.

‘49) Geographer, U. S. Government.
1518 Wayne Drive, Falls Church, Va.
Recent publications: “The Shifting
Geographic Center of Petroleum
Production and Its Effect on Pric
ing Systems,” Econ. Geog. Vol. 28;
“Petroleum in the Soviet Union: An
Appraisal of a Recent German Study,”
Econ. Geog., Vol. 29. He now has two
sons, Dale, born June 18, 1949, and
Donald, born November 25th, 1953.

Adkinson, Burton W. (Ph.D. ‘42)
Director, Reference Department, Li
brary of Congress, Washington, D.C.

Allen, Agnes M. (Ph.D. ‘37) Head
of Science Department, Director of
Student Welfare, Arizona State Col—
lege, Flagstaff, Arizona. Instituted a
special field course at end of summer
sessions designed especially for
teachers in Arizona. State President
of the American Association of Uni
versity Women.

Atwood, Wallace W. Jr. (Ph.D.
‘30) Director, Office of International
Relations, National Academy of
Sciences —National Research Council,
Washington D.C. U.S. delegate to the
UNESCO Working Party conference
held in Paris, July 1953 to consider
the establishment of an International
Advisory Committee on Scientific
Research. Member U.S.A. National
Committee for the International Geo
physical Year, 1957-53.

ilugelli, John P. (‘39-’4-3) Assistant
Professor, University of Maryland,
College Park, Md. Recent publica
tions: “Patterns and Problems of Land
Tenure in the Lesser Antilles,” Econ.
Geog.; “Sugar Cane and Tobacco: A
Comparison of Agricultural Types in
the Highlands of Eastern Puerto
Rico,” Econ. Geog.

Bellinger, Frank If. (M.A. ‘53) In
structor in Geography, Wheaton Col
lege. The family now includes three
boys.

Bengtson, Nels 4. (Ph.D. ‘27)
Professor of Geography and Dean

of the Junior Division, Emeritus, Uni
versity of Nebraska.

Berman, Mildred (M.A. ‘50 In
structor, State Teachers College,
Salem, Mass.

Black, Lloyd D. (M.A. ‘36) Adjunct
Professor of Geography, American
University, Washington, D.C.; Con
sultant, U.S. Forest Service.

Boesch, Hans (‘34-’35) Chairman,
Department of Geography, Univer
sity of Zurich, Switzerland. Vice
President I.G.U. Research on an In
dustrial Map of Switzerland.

Branom, Frederick K. (Ph.D. ‘23)
Chairman, Department of the Social
Sciences, Chicago Teachers College.
Chicago, Ill. Preparing an article
which will be published during the
early part of 1954 for the Chicago
Schools Journal on, “Free and Inex
pensive Materials in the Social
Studies.”

Bollinger, C. J. Associate Professor,
University of Oklahoma, Norman,
OkIa.

Botts, Adelhcrt K. (Ph.D. ‘34)
Chairman, Department of Geography,
New Jersey State Teachers College,
Trenton, New Jersey. Conducted field
trip sponsored jointly by the New
Jersey State Teachers College and
Division of Travel Service, National
Education Association, to Churchill,
Manitoba, August 1953. Taught two
Courses in the Summer School 1953 at
Rutgers University.

Burrill, Meredith F. (Ph.D. ‘30)
Director, Division of Geography, U.S.
Department of Interior, ‘Washington,
D.C.; Executive Secretary, Board on
Geographic Names. Studying at
present topographic terms used in
geographic names.

Burton, Dorothea E. (Ph.D. ‘49)
Major, USMCR, Administrative As
sistant, Training Department, U.S.
Naval Photographic Interpretation
Center, U.S. Naval Receiving Station,
Washington, D.C.

Buzzard, Robert Guy (Ph.D. ‘25)
President, Eastern Illinois State Col
lege, Charleston. Illinois.
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CaIdwell, Harry H. (Ph.D. ‘51) As
sistant Professor, Department of
Geology and Geography, University
of Idaho, Moscow, Idaho. Recent
Publications: “Recreational Resources
and Their Conservation,” Northwest
Conservationist, Vol. XII; “Tourist
Packer Services in Primitive Areas,”
Land Economics, Vol. XXIX. Plans to
write a high school textbook on Idaho’s
Resources and Industries.

Campbell, Robert D. (Ph.D. ‘49)
Chairman, Department of Geography,
George Washington University,
Washington, D.C.; Consultant,
George Washington University, Office
of Naval Research Logistics Research
Project; Principal Investigator, His
torical Records Research Project,
School of Engineering, George Wash
ington University. Recent Publications:
“The Environment—Material Rela
tionship as it Affects Logistic Plan-
fling,” with Walter H. Bailey. Profes
sor Campbell was a Fulbright Lectur
er, Department of Geography, Alexan
dria University, Alexandria, Egypt
for the academic year 1952-53.

Carls, Norman (Ph.D. ‘35) Profes
sor of Geography, American Univer
sity, Washington, D.C., at the present
time is continuing work on a series of
geography textbooks for elementary
schools.

Caughey, Philip M. (‘5-’46) Chair
man of Social Studies, Lexington
Junior High School, Lexington, Mass.

Chew, Margaret S. Chairman, De
partment of Geography, Wisconsin
State College, La Crosse, Wisconsin.
Working on map bibliography for
National Council of Geography
Teachers.

Church, Phil E. (Ph.D. ‘37) Execu
tive Officer, Department of Meteorol
ogy and Climatology, University of
Washington, Seattle 5, Washington.
Elected President of Meteorology Sec
tion, American Geophysical Union for
three years, beginning July, 1953. The
family includes four daughters.

Cox, Catherine E. (M.A. ‘4-2)Lieu-
tenant U.S. Navy, 3701 Conn. Ave.
N.W., Apt. 425, Washington 8, D.C.

Visited Europe in August and Septem
her of 1953.

Grain, Clark N. (Ph.D. ‘51) As
sociate Professor and Chairman of
the Department of Geography, Uni
versity of Denver, Denver 10, Colo
rado. Consultant for two large recla
mation projects in South America,
plans publication of Historical Geog
raphy of Colorado. The family in
cludes four children.

Cressey, George B. (Ph.D. ‘31) Max
well Professor of Geography, Syracuse
University, Syracuse, New York.
Recently completed small volume en
titled “How Strong is Russia?”, Syra
cuse University Press; Article in
Economic Geography, “Changing the
Map of the Soviet Union,” Vol. 29,
1953.

Cre’veling, Harold F., (Ph.D. ‘51)
Head of Department of Geography,
Tampa, Florida. Presented paper to
A.A.G. meeting in Cleveland entitled
“A Method of Determining the Cul
tural Pattern of An American Indus
trial City.” Appointed a member of
Governor’s Committee on Resource
Use Education.

Cunningham, Floyd F., (Ph.D. ‘30)
Chairman of Department of Geogra
phy and Geology, South Illinois Uni
versity, Carbondale, Illinois. Con
ducted seven-week field trip to Alaska
summer of 1953; Fulbright lecturer
at Ibrahim Pasha University and
American University, Cairo, Egypt,
Sept. 1953 to June 1954. Became
grandfather of twins, Joel Wayne and
Jeffrey Alan Jungers in March, 1953.

Danklefsen, Mildred, (M.A. ‘43,
Ph.D. ‘52) Assistant Professor of
Geography, Western Reserve Univer
sity, Cleveland 6, Ohio. The second
National Television Survey report
will be published soon by The Journal
of Geography. Paper now in progress
on The Modernization of the Wabana
Iron Ore Industry of Newfoundland;
plans to write a Geography of Ja
maica. Announces her engagement to
William E. Walmsley, Cleveland At
torney.

Deacon, Nadine Att, (Mrs. Arthur
S.), (‘44-’45) 17 St. Leonardo Ave.,
Toronto 12, Ontario, Canada. A thtrd
child, David, was born June 1, 1953.

Dean, Veva K., (Ph.D. ‘49) Profes
sor of Geography, State Teachers
College, East Stroudsburg, Pa.

Deasy, George F. (Ph.D. ‘48) Pro
fessor of Geography, Pennsylvania
State University, State College, Pa.
Textbook on economic geography now
in process.

Diettrich, Sigismond der, (Ph.D. ‘31)
Head, Department of Geography, Uni
versity of Florida, Gainesville, Flor
ida. Recent papers given: AAG
1952, “The Rainfall of Miami”; Flor
ida Academy of Sciences, 1952, “The
Geographic Factor in Florida’s History
1953,” Two Decades of Florida’s
Truck Crop Industry 1933-34——1952-
53. Recent publications: “Field Work
shop in Resource-Use Education,”
Florida School Bulletin, 1951; “The
Significance of ThOnen’s Theory in
Economic Geography,” Memorandum
Folio, S.E. Div. A.A.G. 1951, “State
Economic Areas, Preliminary Critical
Review,” Memorandum Folio, 1952
“Florida’s Shrimp Industry,” Eco
nomic Leaflets, Vol. 10. “Some Geo
graphic Aspects of the Russian Ex—
pansion,” Education, 1952; “The Geo
graphic Factor in the History of
Bulgaria,” Quarterly Journal, 1952;
“Florida’s Non-Metropolitan Urban
Growth, 1930-1950,” Quarterly Jour
naL As President of the Florida
Academy of Sciences 1954, he hopes
to inaugurate an educational radio
program by the contribution of results
of research of the members of the
Academy. He also reports that his
daughter Rosemary entered the Uni
versity of Florida as a Freshman.

Dornbach, John E. (‘50-’52) Cartog
rapher, Aeronautical Chart and In
formation Center, St. Louis, Missouri.
Instructor (Night School), Washing
ton University, St. Louis, Missouri.
Co-author “Chart Altitude as a Func
tion of Hypsometric Tints,” Na’viga
tion (Journal of the Institute of Navi

gation), 1953. A first child, John
Thomas, was born February 1. 1953.

Dunkle, John R. (‘5l-’52) Instruc
tor of Geography and Physical
Sciences, Department of Geography,
University of Florida. Article on Flor
ida forthcoming in “La Vie del
Mondo.” A first child, John Robert,
Jr., was horn in March of 1953

Elliott, Francis G. (Ph.D. ‘52)
Oceanographer, U.S.N. Hydrographic
Office, Washington, D.C.

Fairchild, Wilma B. (M.A. ‘37)
Editor, Geographical Revie’w,Ameri
can Geographical Society, Broadway
at 156th. St.. New York 32, N.Y.

Fause, 4sbjorn (M.A. ‘35) Cartog
rapher, Pan American World Air
ways. Inc. Home address: 1575 OdeH
Street, New York 62, N.Y. The family
includes two children, Carol-Jo. age
7 and Kenneth, age 5.

Fisk, Brad, Jr. (M.A. ‘50) Head
quarters Co., 30th Engr. Topo. Bn.,
Fort Winfield Scott, San Francisco,
California.

Forward, Charles N. (‘52-’53)
Geographer, Geographical Branch,
Department of Mines and Technical
Surveys. Ottawa, Canada. Recent Pub
lication: “Ice Distribution in the Gulf
of St. Lawrence During the Breakup
Season,” Geographical Bulletin No. 5,
Geographical Branch, Ottawa, Ontario.

Foscue, Edwin J. (Ph.D. ‘31) Chair
man, Department of Geography,
S o u r h e r n Methodist University,
Dallas, Texas. Recent Publication:
Co-author of revised Regional Geog
raphy of iinglo-4merica, to be pub
lished in 1954.

Freeman, Otis W. (Ph.D. ‘29) 2428
Miller St., Seattle 2, Washington.
Professor Emeritus, retired fall of
1953. Elected President, National
Council of Geography Teachers for
1954.

Freile, difonto J. (‘51-’52) Profes
sor of Geography. Universidad de
Panama, Panama. Republic of Pana
ma.

Graham, Guilbert R. (M.A. ‘31)
Associate Professor, Department of
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Geology and Geography, University
of South Carolina.

Green, Howard L. (M.A. ‘49)
Manager, Marketing Research De
partment, Stop and Shop, Inc., 393 D
Street, Boston 10, Massachusetts. A
son, Lanford Curtis, was born August
15, 1953.

Grotewold, .4ndreas (M.A. ‘51)
5635 South Drexel Avenue, Chicago
37, Illinois. Student at University of
Chicago.

Harding, George E. (‘30-’31) Chair
man of the Department of Geography,
Science and Mathematics, State
Teachers College, California, Pa.
Recent Publication: Co-author--—Ele
ments of World Geography.

Held, Colbert C. (Ph.D. ‘49) Assist
ant Professor of Geography, Univer
sity of Nebraska, Lincoln, Nebraska.
Teaching in the University of Mary
land Overseas Program in Europe,
1953-54.

Hir.cchberg, Peter (M.A. ‘51) Ge
ographer, U.S. Government. Home
address: 310 North Thomas Street,
Arlington, Virginia.

Hirst, Mrs. Roy Chairman of the
Science Department, Brearley School,
White Plains, New York.

Hones, Gerald H. (M.A. ‘53)
Senior Geography Master, Harvey
Grammar School, Folkestone, Kent,
England. Recent Publication: “Change
in Romney Marsh,” Geographical
Magazine, 1953. A son, Robin
Anthony, born Feb. 19, 1953.

Flowarth, Margery (M.A. ‘34) Ge
ographer, U.S. Army Map Service,
6,500 Brooks Lane, Washington 25,
D.C. Recent Publication: Co-author of
Neighbors in Latin America, The
John C. Winston Co.

Howe, George F. (M.A. ‘24) As
sociate Professor of Geography,
Teachers College of Connecticut, New
Britain, Conn. Recent Publication: “Do
College Students Know Geography?”
Teacher Education Quarterly.

Howe, George M. (‘48-’50) Clima
tologist and Lieutenant, U.S. Navy.
Home address: 852 South Frederic St.,
Arlington 4, Virginia. Prepared a film

strip with teachers’ guide on Southwest
Germany for the new film strip series
of the American Geographical Society.

Fludgin, Bert. (Ph.D. ‘30) Chair
man of Department of Geography,
rayne University, Detroit, Michigan.
Recent Publications: Michigan-Geo
graphic Backgrounds in the Develop
inent of the Commonwealth, Edwards
Brothers, Ann Arbor, Michigan. A
revision of Miller-Parkins, Geogra
phy of North America, John Wiley.

Hughes, John T. (M.A. ‘52) Ge
ographer, Army Map Service, Wash
ington, D.C.

Hunter, Mrs. Esther K. (M.A. ‘40)
16 Croft Road, Poughkeepsie, New
York. Family now includes five
children.

Jesseman, Jessie M. (Thornton)
(M.A. ‘41) 14 Humphrey Street, Con
cord, New Hampshire.

Keller, Lois R. 3232 East Fairfax
Road, Cleveland Heights 18, Ohio.

Kellogg, David H. (M.A. ‘51)
Junior Planner, Technical Planning
Associates, Inc. 111 Whitney Ave.,
New Haven, Connecticut. Announces
engagement to Miss Ruth E. Mime of
Pittsfield, Massachusetts.

Khan, Azra 1. Rahman (Ph.D. ‘53)
24 Cooper Road, Lahore, Pakistan.

Kircher, Harry B. (‘51-’52) Econ
omist, Federal Reserve Bank of St.
Louis, St. Louis, Missouri. Recent Pub
lications: “From Arkadeiphia to
Zeigler—a Study of the Place of Cities
and Towns in the Eighth District
Economy,” Monthly Review, Federal
Reserve Bank of St. Louis, July, 1953.

Kistler, Esther L. (M.A. ‘38) 212
State St., Nanticoke, Pa.

Lame, Oliver H. (Ph.D. ‘53) Instruc
tor in Geography, State Teachers
College, Towson 4, Maryland.

Laing, Jean (‘50-’52) Assistant,
Geography Department, The Univer
sity of Glasgow, Glasgow, Scotland.

Langdon, George (Ph.D. ‘51) Pro
fessor of Geography, State Teachers
College, Mansfield, Penna. Recent Pub
lication: “Evolution of a Transporta
tional Route as the Core of a Suburban

Region,” Scienti/Ic. Monthly, 1953. Son
George is now 18 months old.

Leipold, Louis E. (M.A. ‘46) Branch
Chief, West Europe Branch, Engineer
Strategic Intelligence Division, Army
Map Service, Washington, D.C. Served
as program chairman of the Middle
Atlantic Division of the AAG for
1953. Toured the Southwest and hopes
to spend a month or two in Europe
next summer.

Lemaire, Minnie B. (Ph.D. ‘35) As
sociate Professor of Geography,
Mount Holyoke College, South Hadley,
Mass. Traveled last summer in France,
Spain, Italy, Switzerland.

Line/jan, Urban J. (M.A. ‘46) As
sistant Professor of Geography, Catho
lic University of America, ‘Washing
ton, D.C. At the present working on
his Ph.D. dissertation entitled: “Tor
nado Deaths in the United States.” A
daughter, Katherine Ann, arrived last
June.

Little, Dana A. (M.A. ‘51) Strategic
Branch, 500th MISG, APO 613, c/o
PM San Francisco, Calif.

Lloyd, Trevar (Ph.D. ‘40) Profes
sor of Geography, Dartmouth College,
Hanover, N.H. Recent Publications:
Joint author of 1€ Canada et ses
Joisios and Southern Lands, two
school texts for use in Canada. He
is teaching a new course, “Regional
Geography of Northern Lands” at
Dartmouth. Completed research on
the regional geography of North Nor
way and plans a Continuation of re
search on South Norway and on
Greenland in addition to contributing
to a regional geography of Northern
Lands.

Logan, Richard F. (M.A. ‘37) As
sistant Professor, Geography Depart
ment, University of California, Los
Angeles, Calif. He is conducting re
search, under contract to the Quarter
master Corps, in the geography of a
desert mountain range—the Provi
dence Mts. of the eastern Mojave
Desert. Conducted field trips to Ven
tura Co., Calif., and to the Santa
Monica Mountains.

Macgan, Bradford K. (‘38-’39)
Assistant Professor of Geography and
Geology. University of Chattanooga.
Chattanooga, Tenn.

Marsingall-Thomas, (Curnow) I.
I. (Research Fellow ‘28) 36 Ducks
Hill Road, Northwood-Middle. Eng
land. She has two children, one daugh
ter Ann, age 24 who is Assistant Sci.
Officer Medical Research Council and
second daughter is continuing her
studies.

Mason, Carol Y. (Ph.D. ‘36 As
sociate Professor of Geography, Uni
versity of Tulsa, Tulsa, Oklahoma,

Matzat, Willi (‘51-’52) Student,
University of Goettingen, Bad Soden/
Taunus, Koenigsteinerstr. 27, Ger
many.

Maung, U Them (M.A. ‘52) Lec
turer and Head of Geography Depart
ment, University College, Mandalay,
Burma. He reports that a son was
born to Mrs. Maung after his return
to Mandalay from Clark University.
He now has three children (a daugh
ter and two sons). Plans to write
“The Geography of Burma” with the
cooperation of Dr. G. B. Schilz, an
alumnus of Clark University.

McConnel, Wallace R. (Ph.D. ‘25)
Professor of Geography, Emeritus,
Miami University, Oxford. Ohio. After
34 years as Professor of Geography
retired in June, 1952. Reports that.
“teaching was to me a constant source
of joy and inspiration as well as a
constant challenge.” Taught geogra
phy during the Summer Sessions in
Rhode Island College of Education at
Providence during the summers of
1952 and 1953. Plans to give a few
lectures and do a limited amount of
Writing.

McDavitt, Ne’va (M.A. ‘29) 402
Normal Ave., Normal, Ill.

McIntyre, Wallace E. (Ph.D. 51)
Associate Professor, Geography De
partment, Illinois State Normal Uni
versity, Normal, Illinois. Recent Pub
lication: “Philippine Fish Culture,”
Scientific Monthly. Plans to publish
soon a textbook in physical geography
for public schools in Pakistan. Just
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returned from a year as Fuibright
Lecturer at the University of the
Philippines.

Miller, Rex C. 3255 23rd Street S.E.,
Washington, D.C.

Minogue, James A. (M.A. ‘37) De
partment of the Army, Pentagon,
Washington, D.C. Reports that four
growing daughters and fifty acres
on the Blue Ridge account for nearly
all of his spare time.

Moore, Jean (‘46-’47) Box 488,
Canyon, Texas.

Morrison, Paul C. (Ph.D. ‘41) Pro
fessor, Department of Geology and
Geography, Michigan State College,
East Lansing, Michigan. Recent Pub
lications: with T. L. Norris, “Some
Aspects of Life on a Large Costa
Rican Coffee Finca,” Pap. Mich. Jicad.
of Sci., Arts, and Letters, 38 (1952)
with T. L. Norris, “Coffee Production
and Processing on a Large Costa
Rican Finca,” Pap. Mich. A cad. of
Sci., Arts, and Letters, 39 (1953)
co-author of the “Setting of the Study,”
a chapter in Loomis, et al. Turrialba:
Social Systems and the Introduction
of Change; chapter on “West Indies,”
in School and Library Atlas of the
World.

Myers, M. W. (Ph.D. ‘48) Profes
sor of Geography, Dept. of Geology
and Geography, Mississippi State Col
lege, Miss. Conducted a fourth an
nual summer field course on a month-
long trip to California and the Pacific
Northwest during the last summer.

Nelson, Herman L. (‘50-’52) Assist
ant Professor in Earth Science, Science
Department, Iowa State Teachers
College, Cedar Falls, Iowa. At
present is working on a combina
tion outline-syllabus for general edu
cation course in the earth sciences.
Will spend this coming summer in
Europe.

Nichols, Norton J. (M.A. ‘50)
Chairman, Social Science Dept., Ante
lope Valley Joint Union High School,
Lancaster, Calif. Married in Llanelly,
Wales, 1952.

O’Brien, Anne K. (M.A. ‘35) 123
Monadnock Road, Worcester, Mass.
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Olson, Ralph E. (Ph. D.’46) Profes
sor, Department of Geography, Uni
versity of Oklahoma, Norman, Okla
homa.

Packard, Leonard P. (M.A. ‘26)
Former Professor of Geography,
Teachers College of the City of Bos
ton. Now retired and living at 78
Warren Street, Needham, Mass.

Parker, Harry C. (M.A. ‘38) Park
Naturalist, Crater Lake National
Park, Fort Kiamath, Oregon.

Pawlikowski, Daniel F. (‘51-’52)
Social Studies teacher, Bridgeport,
Conn. 338 Greenfield Street, Bridge
port, Coon.

Perry, Robert F., Jr. (‘52-’53) In
structor, Department of Geography,
Salem State Teachers College, Salem,
Mass.

Pico, Rafael (Ph.D. ‘38) Chairman,
Puerto Rico Planning Board, Box 26,
Roosevelt, Puerto Rico. Recent Pub
lication: Co-editor with C. F. Jones
on book “Symposium on the Geography
of Puerto Rico” to be published by
the University of P.R. Plans trip to
India in January to attend Seminar on
Housing and Planning as United
Nations Discussion Leader.

Pruser, Etha M. (M.A. ‘54) Adver
tising, Gimbel Brothers, N.Y. Present
address: 121-13 Liberty Ave., Rich
mond Hill, N.Y. Left AMS in Wash
ington in 1953 to complete thesis en
titled: “Some Observations on the
Nature of U.S. State Capitals.”

Quam, Louis 0. (Ph.D. ‘38) Head,
Geography Branch Office of Naval
Research, Washington, D.C. Attended
Pacific Science Congress in Manila,
Philippine Islands in November of
last year.

Reith, John W. (M.A. ‘4.1) Associate
Professor and Head of Department.
Geography Department, University of
Southern California, Los Angeles,
California. Recent publications: with
G. T. Renner, “We are Overlooking
Geography,” J. of Nat. Ed. Assoc.
1953; “The United States of Brazil,”
in second edition of Pearcy and Fifield,
World Political Geography (in press).

Reith, Gertrude M. (‘40-’42) Lec
turer in Geography and Marketing,
University of Southern California,
University College, Los Angeles,
California. Working on articles for
Encyclopedia Britannica Jr., on the
Pacific S.W. as well as the extremely
efficient homemaker for the Reith
family which now includes two chil
dren, Helen and Herby.

Risley, Edward M. (‘47-’48) Air
Intelligence Specialist, 402 Beechwood
Road, Alexandria, Virginia. A son,
Christopher, was born January 23,
1953.

Ristow, Waltcr W. (Ph.D. ‘37) As
sistant Chief, Map Division, Library
of Congress, Washington, D.C. Recent
publications: “Bibliographic Record of
the 17th International Geographical
Congress,” I.G.U. Newsletter, 1953;
“Cartographic Exhibits,” Surveying
and Mapping; with Clara E. Le Gear,
“A Bibliographic Guide to Historical
Cartography,” (in press).

Roberts, M. Catherine (Ph.D. ‘38)
Head of Geography Department, State
Teachers College, Potsdam, N.Y.

Robertson, ma C. (M.A. ‘24) Head
of Department, State Teachers Col
lege, Valley City, North Dakota. Offi
cial delegate of the National Council
of Geography Teachers at the UNE
SCO Conference 1953.

Robinson, J. Lewis (Ph.D. ‘46) Pro
fessor and Chairman, Department of
Geography, University of British
Columbia, Vancouver, British Colum
bia. Edited a new physical-political
map of Canada and British Columbia.
Now completing a 200-page work of
a new geography course, “Geography
of British Columbia.” for use in Grade
10 in B.C. High Schools. His wife,
M. Josephine Robinson (Rowan),
Clark, M.A. 1943, is now teaching
part-time at the Vancouver School for
the Deaf. Future plans are a revi
sion of text, The Geography of
Canada.

Salley, Paul V. (M.A. ‘51) Geogra
phy Instructor, State Teachers Col
lege, Gorham, Me. Two births to

report: Michael, May 30, 1952, and
Paula, June 23, 1953.

Schadegg, Francis J. (M.A. ‘37)
Chairman, Department of Geogra
phy, Eastern Washington College of
Education, Cheney, Wyoming.

Shank, Marjorie (M.A. ‘23) Geog
raphy Department, Southern Illinois
University, Carbondale, Illinois.

Sha’w, Earl B. (Ph.D. 33) Profes
sor of Geography, State Teachers
College. Worcester Mass. Papers
given: “Egypt’s Land Reform Law,”
National Council of Geography
Teachers Conference, 1953; “A Re
connaissance Journey in the South
Sudan,” AAAS Conference 1953. Re
turned from a Fulbrighr year of lec
turing at Ibrahim University, Cairo,
Egypt in June, 1953, and is now back
teaching at Worcester S.T.C.

Shear, James A. (Ph.D. ‘52) Assist
ant Professor, Department of Geog
raphy, University of Kentucky, Lex
ington, Ky. Papers given: “The Mean
Center, A Neglected Analytical Tool.”
AAG Southeast Div.; “Variability of
Precipitation in the United States,”
Cleveland meeting of AAG. The
family now includes three children,
Ray, Elizabeth, and Susan.

Shipman, Julia M. (Ph.D. ‘28)
Retired, East Arlington, Vt.

Simmons, A. G. E. (M.A. ‘35) Head,
Geography Department, State Teach
ers College, Fitchburg, Mass. Hopes
to travel widely in Mexico this
summer.

Smith. Helen Boyer (M.A. ‘38)
3255 Uplands Road, Victoria, B.C.,
Canada.

Smith, Helen L. (‘48-’49) Associate
Professor of Geography, Wheaton
College, Wheaton, Illinois. Returned
in September from Bangkok, Thai
land where she taught at Chulalong
horn University under a Fuibright
award.

Sobol, John A. (M.A. ‘49) Teach
ing Fellow, Department of Geogra
phy, University of Michigan. Ann
Arbor, Michigan. Tentative title of
dissertation: “The Geographic Aspects
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of the Iron and Steel Industry in
Chile.”

Specht, Raymond E. (M.A. ‘47)
Chairman, Geography Department,
Wisconsin State College, Stevens
Point, Wisconsin. Planning a summer
field trip to New England and
Canada.

Stacey, Karl (‘49-’50) Associate
Professor, Department of Geology,
Kansas State College, Manhattan,
Kansas.

Stoneman, Elvyn A. (Ph.D. ‘50)
Section Chief, Physical Geography,
Near East—Africa Branch, Engineer
Strategic Intelligence Division, Army
Map Service, Washington, D.C.

Sumner, Alfred R. (Ph.D. ‘49) As
sistant Professor of Geography, San
Francisco State College, San Francis
co, California. This summer he is
planning to conduct a geographical
tour of the world by air.

Taylor, I. L. (Ph.D. ‘53) Consul
tant on Territories and Possessions
for the Committee on Interior and
Insular Affairs, House of Representa
tives, Washington, D.C. Recent Pub
lication: “Teaching Materials Pro
duced in the Trust Territory of the
Pacific Islands,” South Pacific Corn
mission. Q. Bulletin, Vol. 3. Last
spring served as liaison officer with
the Visiting Mission of the United
Nations Trusteeship Council on its
tour of the Pacific. This winter ac
companied a congressional party to
the Virgin Islands and Puerto Rico.

Terrell, R. Paul (Ph.D. ‘49) Head
of Department of Geography and
Geology, Western Kentucky State
College, Bowling Green, Ky. Paoer
given: “Manufacturing in Kentucky.”
Southea’tern Div. AAG, 1953.

Tobey, Ray W. (M.A. ‘53) Teacher
of Geography and Curator of Mineral
Collections, Choate School, Walling-
ford, Connecticut.

Van Cleef, Eugene (Ph.D. ‘26)
Professor of Geography and Business
Organization. Ohio State University,
Columbus. Ohio. Appointed member
of Committee on Climate in Relation
to Building and City Planning of the
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American Meteorological Society. Re
writing book on urbanism.

Van De Bunt, Wouter (Ph.D. ‘52)
Staff, Central Planning Bureau, K.L.
M. Royal Dutch Airlines, The Hague,
Netherlands. R e c e n t publication:
“Sanaibar, La Perla deli’ Equatore,”
Le Vie del Mondo, Italian Geography
Magazine, December 1952; article in
process, “The Development of Dutch
Civil Aviation,” for the Netherlands
Journal of Economic and Social Geog
raphy. President, The Hague Circle
of Dutch-American Fulbright Ex
changees. V

Van Royen W. (Ph.D. ‘28) Chair
man, Department of Geography, Uni
versity of Maryland, Silver Springs,
Md. At present is continuing work
on the Atlas of the World’s Resources,
Vol. III, dealing with forest and fish
resources. Last summer was spent in
Europe teaching one course in the
Overseas Program of the University
of Maryland at Wiesbaden, Germany;
giving some special lectures to Air
Force officers at A.F.H.W.; consulted
with regular geography instructors in
the Program; and visited several times
in the Netherlands and in Switzerland.

Vogt, Mary C. (Mrs. B. C. Wood
land) (M.A. ‘43) Research Student,
Department of Geology, Bedford Col
lege, Regent’s Park, London, N.W.
1, England. Completing Ph.D. thesis:
“Tectonics and Petrofabric Structures
in Ballachulish and Glen Coe, Argyll
shire.”

Vouras, Paul P. (M.A. ‘51) Gradu
ate Assistant, Department of Geog
raphy, Ohio State University, Colum
bus, Ohio.

Vozka, Henry (‘30-’31) 17670
Cooley, Detroit, Michigan.

Wallace, Lillian H. (M.A. ‘41) As
sistant Professor of Geography, State
Teachers College, Westfield, Mass.

Wea’ver, Miles W. (M.A. ‘51) As
sociate Planner, Providence Rede
velopment Agency, 14 Highland
Street, Cranston, Rhode Island.

iVest, Seymour (M.A. ‘41) Intelli
gence Officer, 208 Martha’s Rd., Hol

lin Hills, Alexandria, Va. Second son,
David, born Sept. 1952.

Whittem ore, Katheryne T. Profes
sor of Geography, College for Teach
ers, State University of New York,
Buffalo, N.Y. Visited Winnipeg last
summer.

Wraight, A. I. (Ph.D. ‘51) Geog
rapher, U.S. Coast and Geodetic
Survey, Geographic Consultant, U.S.
Department of Justice, Washington,
D.C. Recent publications: “Geography
of Tidelands Oil,” Social Order, 1953;
book Field Handbook to be published
this year; in progress. “Coastal Place
Names.”

Wright, Marion I. (M.A. 46) As
sociate Professor of Geography and
Chairman of the Social Studies Divi
sion, Rhode Island College of Educa
tion, Providence, R.I. Traveled over
6,000 miles by car in Europe during
the past summer.

Zeller, Rose (Ph.D. ‘40’ Professor
of Geography, Eastern Illinois State
College, Charleston, Illinois.

Zuber, Leo J. (‘48-’49) Assistant
Director, Metropolitan Planning Com
mission, 808 Glenn Building, Atlanta,
Georgia. Visiting Lecturer in City
Planning, School of Architecture,
Georgia Institute of Technology in ad
dition to Congress Director, Southern
Regional Congress on City Planning.
Recent publications: A Planning Direc
tory of the Southeastern States, South
east Chapter, Am. Inst. of Planners,
1953; co-compiler of A Planning
Bibliography, Metropolitan Planning
Commission, 1953. A son, Peter
Andrew, was horn November 17,
1953.

NEW CUGS MEMBER
During the Spring semester a new

member joined the CUGS. Eddie
Kersch, free, 22, and single, arrived
from Detroit, Michigan after having
obtained a B.A degree in January
from Wayne University. His hobbies
include music (piano playing and
classical record collecting), travel, and
photography.
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VISITING LECTURERS

The Graduate School of Geography
was again privileged tu hear four
visiting lecturers this year. The fields
discussed in keeping with the tradition
of letting Clark students hear from
“the outside” covered most of the
continents of the globe in addition to
the systematic fields of methodology,
urban and social geography.

Dr. Preston James, Syracuse Uni
versity and Clark alumnus, gave 3
lectures last semester. He spoke on
the concepts and methods of geogra
phy with practical application to his
special field of N. E. Brazil.

Dr. Earl Shaw, another alumnus of
Clark and now Professor of Geogra
phy at Worcester State Teachers Col
lege, spoke on Egypt, its problems and
future.

Dr. R. E. Dickinson, Professor of
Geography at Syracuse University,
arrived in March to give a series of
5 lectures. He had spent the year
1951-1952 in field work in Italy on
grants from the Social Science Re
search Council and the Office of
Naval Research and presented a sum
mary of his findings on Land Reform
in Southern Italy. In addition, 2
lectures each were given on the back
ground and problems of social geog

STAFF MEMBER
COMMENDED

Dr. Raymond E. Murphy
received a “Citation for Merito
rious Contribution to the Field
of Geography” at the 50th An
niversary Meeting of the A. A.
G. April 14th in Philadelphia.
The award was “for outstand
ing success in bringing to Eco
nomic Geography broad profes
sional support and a high degree
of editorial excellence.”



A LAMENTraphy and in his special field of urban
geography.

Dr. Charles A. Fisher, a member of
the faculty of University College,
Leicester, England and presently a
visiting lecturer at Yale University,
honored us with a timely discussion of
southeast Asia. Professor Fisher was
extremely well versed on the ways
of life and thought of the Asiatics
having spent the greater part of the
war as a prisoner of the Japanese.

All of the visiting lecturers were
honored by the traditional tea held in
Libby Library.

CUGS SOCIAL ACTIVITIES

The social season at Clark Gradu
ate School of Geography was high
lighted by four outstanding events.
The first was a Christmas banquet
held at White Cliffs in Marlboro. The
evening was complete with turke”
humorous Christmas gifts presented
to CUGS and Staff, carol singing with
an international touch, and dancing.
This initial social venture was labeled
a marked success and resulted in three
more during the spring semester.

An unusual and uni”ue affair was
held on Thursday, March 18. The
“salt mines” took on a festive air
when the ping-pong table and addi
tional tables were adorned with table
cloths of colored comic papers and
touches of crepe paper. In this setting,
an informal spaghetti supper, which
had been prepared in the kitchens
of various members was served. Ap
proximately sixty members and Staff
supped and sang.

On April 2, the annual spring
banquet was held at Sterling Inn. Dr.
Deiter Brunnschweiler and Dr. Has-
san Awad were honored guests. Gifts
were presented to these two visiting
professors as a token of apprecia
tion by the Graduate School of Geog
raphy. This enjoyable and most
memorable affair was attended by all
CUGS and Staff.

On the opening day of the reading
period, May 1, a picnic was held.
Canoeing, boating, swimming, soft
ball and volleyball were enthusiasti
cally participated in by the jovial
group who attended this outdoor
gathering. These activities together
with especially fine weather and a
perfect location on Lake Singletary,
Sutton made for an ideal day and
climax to the social year.

(With apologii’s to Kipling a,zd
Rob’rt Dacjis)

When your learnin’ days are over
And the books are shot with dust,
Remember, brother, all that trouble
You took, just to let it rust,
Working for a Clark Degree.

Monday, Wednesday, Friday morning
Before the rooster raised his crow,
We sat sleepy, dazed and rigid
Waiting for the numbing blow.
Koppenizing for a Clark Degree.

A little later in each morning
Certain problems raised their head.
Sparicio, would you show by dots,

bananas
If they all grew on coal beds?
(Economizing for a Clark Degree.)

Tuesdays filled with many courses
Must be jammed with double threat.
Many experts filled with terror,
Dr. Van keeps their foreheads wet.
Politicking for a Clark Degree.

Next with all the students gathered
Brunnschweiler without lecturing long,
Brought mighty Penck and Noble

Davis
Back to argue which is wrong.
Geomorphing for a Clark Degree.

Urban types were then appearing
After all had gone before,
Crawling out of second stories.
Dragging maps of street and floor.
Urbanizing for a Clark Degree.

Tuesday afternoons were opened
By a gathering most select.
Minds dwelt on cultural Contact
And strained for their effect.
Seminaring for a Clark Degree.

Finally came some animation,
Changing Science to an art:
By means of wrapping paper
‘eVe achieved it from the start.
Sketching for a Clark Degree.

When your learnin’ days are over
And the books are shot with dust,
Remember, brother, all that trouble
You took, just to let it rust,
Working for a Clark Degree.
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